RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

T <, 31k 23(3)] HIHER, Tt 3, R013/3MTTE 93, ITh 2]%Y [y 3, féma : B0 .00

3TETEINUT ShHTeh G0

TR AehT9T

HERTE ITEAT TR fefadi-ad aar shetet
(T Uk, Teh- 37 3ATTUT Ueh-oF ATHEA UTHg shelel (MEH T 39T Aredtaiad ) fam a smawr.

Iea o a reror fowmr
T, HIEMH HTHT HI, ST TS =i,
e Yoo 033, faih 3 el RoR3.

Iferg=r=T

[N

HERT WTdSI-eh faamite Afafaam, R0¢s.

i IR, R02¢/9 3. ¢R/faR1-3.— TeRTE AresiHe faamiie 2ifafTaw, 3028 (o9 =T Hel. §)
AT HeAd 92 = UIe-shetd (&) THT Hetd 93 < UIe-ahetd (20 ) FgN M hiuaTd Sfeied A= sl
&, RIS I, FigR, FeRTE Hiasi—eh faendic faemdis mfusmien dainatlicl smehsT Srefauararsdean
FRTGART et ThRey uRfaw fafed wd oTe, Ted aRf=M, Q02 TEd WTCeTIHTor FEROT hid 378 :—

9. I IR, HERTE Sresie foriie (famdie mitemui=n deshimHier s defauarered=
FrRiTgdr) (ufectt GURoT) THET URfFEE, 033 1 ®U,

. BRI etk foamdie (faemdiis miterui=an dahiveier shiehrs! Srelfauararad=a srRugdr )
THET URIH 09¢, AT hadd R & WIATAYH deed H0Ad Id 3T :—

() re-shatd ¢ Heller “<resi qut feaw” Wastt “derT quf feam” o 98e Shivard 4d ole.
() Ue-shem R e ‘A quf feem” Uarstt “<aT ot feas” o/ 9 ahvdnd 4q 3.
(3) Yre-he™ 3 Hdier “dadi quf feas” Wast “|rd qof feaq” o1 9ea udnd ad 3%,
(%) Ue-sher ¥ WEe “de quf fee” Uestt ‘o quf foed” ST 9eel SheuErd I 3.
(&) dre-she™ 4 Heier “arar quf fea” Tastt “dF foad” 3/ aea uard 3d ST,

(2)




HERTSE YITH IS STETENUT WA =H-9, Je 3, R023/37THTE 2R, I1h 23%Y

3. UERIE Hiesie foamdie (faemdis miterui=an daigeier shHehst areauararad=a shrRagdr )
ThHET IR, 202R, AT Thetd R Tl WY THeld ¢ = THIORT I Id 318 :—

R¢. ISl o SUIl HRETS —

foemdior= wel wifereRiuT=an Heifera eeai1 o=t fohar -t feha sgleqsiy fohar o7y Hew
AT AT AT QUaTd U Skl o1 are R Suand Sfiedr Al e

TERT J9UTel Il SCRIgER g =1,

AT AT,

M 39 Gid.




TERTS ITEH TSI STETERIT T TR-, T 3, 033/ ATHTE 23, Ieh 23%Y 3

HIGHER AND TECHNICAL EDUCATION DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 3rd July 2023.

NOTIFICATION
MAHARASHTRA PuBLIic UNIVERSITIES AcT, 2016.

No. Parini-2018/C.R.89/UE-2.— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (10) of
section 72 read with sub-section (5) of section 71 of the Maharashtra Public Universities Act,
2016 (Mah.VI of 2017) the Government of Maharashtra hereby amends the Maharashtra Public
Universities (Procedure for conduct of business at the Meetings of Authorities of the University)
Uniform Statute, 2019, as follows, namely :—

(1) This Statute may be called as the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for
conduct of business at the meetings of the Authorities of the University) (First Amendment)
Uniform Statute, 2023.

(2) In clause 2 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of business
at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019,—

(i) in sub-clause (1) for the words “forty clear days”, the words “fifteen clear days”
shall be substituted.

(i1) in sub-clause (2) for the words “thirty clear days”, the words “ten clear days”
shall be substituted.

(i17) in sub-clause (3) for the words “twenty-five clear days”, the words “seven clear
days” shall be substituted.

(iv) in sub-clause (4) for the words “fifteen clear days”, the words “five clear days”
shall be substituted.

(v) in sub-clause (5) for the words “five clear days”, the words “three clear days”
shall be substituted.

(3) After clause 97 of the Maharashtra Public Universities (Procedure for conduct of
business at the meetings of the authorities of the University) Uniform Statute, 2019, the
following clause shall be inserted namely :—

98. mode of delivery for notice of meeting :—

Notice of meeting of all the authorities of the University, served to the concerned
members through letter or e-mail or whatsapp or short messaging service (sms), will
be deemed to be properly delivered.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

AJIT BAWISKAR,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



